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Description
The study of pathology examines the causes and con-
sequences of illness or injury. The study of disease in 
general, which encompasses a wide range of biological 
research areas and medical specialties, is referred to as 
pathology. Although the term “general pathology” refers 
to a number of different but related medical specialties 
that diagnose disease, primarily through the analysis of 
tissue, cell, and body fluid samples, it is frequently used 
in a more restricted sense when used in the context of 
contemporary medical treatment. The word “the many 
different forms of cancer have diverse pathologies” is 
an example of an idiomatic use of the term “pathology,” 
whenever the term “pathophysiologies” would be more 
appropriate. The prefix “pathy” is also occasionally used 
to denote a state of disease in cases of both physical 
illness and psychological conditions. A pathologist is a 
medical professional who specialized in pathology.
History
The study of pathology, which involves a thorough ex-
amination of the body, including dissection and research 
into particular diseases, has a long history. The records 
of the earliest historical societies, including those of the 
Middle East, India, and China, attest to the presence of 
rudimentary comprehension of numerous situations 
in the majority of early cultures. By the Hellenic peri-
od of ancient Greece, a concentrated causative study of 
disease was under way, and numerous eminent early 
physicians had devised techniques for disease diagno-
sis and prognosis. From these Greek origins, the Roman 
and Byzantine medical traditions persisted. However, 
like with many fields of scientific study, after the Classi-
cal Era, progress in medical knowledge slowed down a 
bit but continued to quietly advance throughout many 
nations. Especially noteworthy were the numerous 
complicated pathology texts that were created through-
out the mediaeval era of Islam, which were also based 

on the Greek tradition.
-

sicians who examined sickness and the informal study 
of what they called “pathological anatomy” or “morbid 
anatomy” helped modern pathology emerge as a dis-
tinct field of study. However, it wasn’t until the late 19th 
and early 20th centuries, with the emergence of in-depth 
study of microbiology, that pathology as a formal field of 
specialty was completely created. The belief in humors 
or even spiritual agents, which had predominated for 
much of the previous 1,500 years in European medicine, 

disease-causing microorganisms, or “germs,” existed 
and were capable of reproduction and multiplication. 
With a better grasp of the underlying causes, doctors 
started comparing the traits of one germ’s symptoms as 
they manifested in a patient to those of another germ’s 
traits and symptoms. This method produced the funda-
mental knowledge that diseases may reproduce them-
selves and can have a wide range of significant and 
diverse consequences on the human host. Medical ex-
perts employed the most prevalent and well accepted 
theories or symptoms of their age to identify the origins 
of ailments, a general principle of approach that is still 
used in modern medicine.
The subsequent development of the tissue-analysis mi-
croscope, to which Rudolf Virchow made a key contri-
bution, led to a plethora of research advancements and 
was particularly important in the advancement of mod-
ern medicine. Pathology was recognized as a medical 
specialty by the late 1920s or early 1930s. By the start 

divide into a number of distinct fields, which led to the 
development of a significant number of contemporary 
specialties within pathology and related disciplines of 
diagnostic medicine. This split was accompanied by ad-
vancements in our understanding of general physiology.
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of the 20th century, the study of pathology had begun to 

was replaced in the 19th  century by the realization that 

During the 19th  century, natural philosophers and phy


